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Abstract 
BACKGROUND: Radiotechnologists are always in contact with chemicals during the process of confirmation and 

appearance of radiographs. This study evaluated the prevalence of darkroom disease among the 

radiotechnologists and nurses working in radiology centers of Guilan University of Medical Sciences, Iran. 

METHODS: This cross-sectional study was conducted between two groups of radiotechnologists and nurses from 

selected hospitals of Guilan University of Medical Sciences, in year 2016, including 323 radiotechnologists (n = 140 

people) and nurses (n = 183 people) working in educational therapy centers. The participants were selected through 

convenience sampling method. Total information on darkroom disease was collected using the standard Damases 

questionnaire, and analyzed using SPSS software at the significance level of P < 0.050. 

RESULTS: The mean age of radiotechnologists was 34.01 ± 7.9, and the mean age of nurses was 32.33 ± 7.90 

years. Symptoms of nausea (P = 0.001), runny nose (P = 0.001), oral ulcer (P = 0.020), burning mouth  

(P = 0.001), skin rash (P = 0.001), blurred vision (P = 0.002) night sweats (P = 0.001), chemical taste (P = 0.001), 

and dysuria (P = 0.001) were significantly more common in the radiotechnologists group. Regarding gender and 

symptoms of darkroom disease in each occupational group, nausea (P = 0.024) and runny nose (P = 0.001) 

among the radiotechnologists and chemical taste (P = 0.001) among the nurses, had significant relationship with 

being woman. 

CONCLUSION: The prevalence of darkroom disease was high among the radiotechnologists in Guilan Province, Iran. 

Therefore, it is recommended to improve the quality of services provided, as well as to promote the health and safety of 

radiology personnel through preparing and implementing modern digital equipment in radiology departments. 
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Introduction1
 

Chemicals have become part of human life, 
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especially in the prevention, treatment, and 
control of diseases. If used improperly, they 
put human health at risk, and have irreversible 
effects on the environment.1,2 

Continuous exposure to chemicals has side 
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effects such as asthma, skin inflammation, and 
allergies.3 More than 200 known agents may 
cause asthma.4,5 The most noteworthy cases of 
discomfort and complaint among 
radiotechnologists occur as the result of 
working with the processing device, the vapor 
caused by image processing and radiography 
film processing in the darkroom.5 The 
widespread use of chemicals in the processing 
of radiology images has raised professional 
concerns about the darkroom disease.6-9 
Darkroom disease has various types of allergic 
reactions (headache, itchy skin, shortness of 
breath, mouth ulcers, arrhythmias, painful 
joints, runny nose/adenoid, and nausea),10,11 
which is similar to the symptoms reported by 
miners in exposure to SO2.1 According to the 
American Society of Radiologic Technologists, 
the most common symptom is headache 
(among 39.4% of radiotechnologists).6,12 

The chemicals used in the processing and 
forming steps are formaldehyde, sulfur 
dioxide and glutaraldehyde, hydroquinone, 
sodium sulfite, ammonium chloride, and silver 
compounds.13,14 According to studies, very 
little inhalation of the vapor from 
glutaraldehyde causes possible respiratory 
problems.13 In addition, hydroquinone and 
toxic vapors of SO2 from the processor device 
are harmful to the health of the workers.15-17 

In order to replace the processing and 
forming drug, to examine their qualitative 
status, to place the film in the processor device, 
and also to clean the internal components of 
the processor, radiotechnologists are forced to 
have direct contact with image processing and 
forming substance. At the same time, 
inhalation of chemical vapors, direct contact 
with processing and forming drug, and visual 
observation can cause various allergic diseases. 
In this regard, principles and rules have been 
adopted in several countries (including 
Zimbabwe and the United States) for people 
exposed to chemical agents.18 

The symptoms mentioned in the study of 

Spicer et al., due to the lack of a control group, 
cannot be specific to those involved in the 
radiology department. However, Nallon et al. 
used the physiotherapists as the control group, 
and examined the prevalence of darkroom 
disease.10,19 In the study of Al Zabadi and 
Nazzal, the symptoms reported in 
radiotechnologists were significantly higher 
than nurses (control group).20 The study of 
Jalalvandi et al. in Kermanshah, Iran, showed a 
significant relationship between the darkroom 
disease and radiotechnologists.11 

Radiology, as the first choice in diagnostic 
procedures, plays a very important role in 
patients’ health. In addition, the workers’ 
health will increase productivity and 
efficiency. The study of Al Zabadi and Nazzal 
in another country's cultural context,20 as well 
as the study of Jalalvandi et al. in Iran,11 using 
a researcher-made tool, investigated this 
important disease. However, its examination 
with standard and trusted instruments can 
identify all aspects of darkroom disease in 
radiotechnologists, and improve the safety and 
security of the radiology department staff.  

Considering the small number of studies 
conducted in this regard in Iran, and the lack of 
documented information in Guilan province, 
the prevalence of this disease and its related 
factors, the present study was conducted to 
determine the prevalence of darkroom disease 
among the radiotechnologists working in 
hospitals affiliated to Guilan University of 
Medical Sciences. 

Materials and Methods 

In this cross-sectional study, 323 participants  
(140 radiotechnologists and 183 nurses) in 
educational hospitals of Guilan University of 
Medical Sciences in 2016, were enrolled using 
convenience sampling method. In a preliminary 
study on 30 people of target groups, the 
proportion of the symptoms of darkroom 
disease was 50% and 70% for nurses and 
radiotechnologists, respectively, and the 
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difference between them was 20%. With 
assumptions (α = 0.05, β-1 = 0.9, P1-P2 = 0.02, 
and 95% of confidence interval), the steps were 
loaded into the PASS sampling software (NCSS, 
LLC, East Kaysville, UT, USA) and were 
evaluated (Power = 0.9003, N1 = 110, N2 = 143). 
Considering 20% sample dropping, 140 people 
were calculated for radiotechnologists group 
and 183 people for the nursing group. 

One of the criteria for selecting hospitals 
was an active darkroom in the radiology 
departments of the hospital. Nurses, who did 
not have a history of working with chemicals 
used for radiographic processing and forming, 
were selected. Hospitals were selected at two 
levels of provincial capital and cities, in order 
to measure the performance of the devices and 
the amount of X-ray request (workload). 
Having at least an academic degree in 
radiology technology or nursing, and 
willingness to complete the questionnaire were 
the criteria for entering the study.    

The used data gathering tool was Damases 
standard questionnaire,21 whose validity and 
reliability is desirable, and has been used in 
various studies in Iran and other countries in 
regard with darkroom disease.11,12,20-22 This 
questionnaire consists of 50 questions and 
includes 3 sections: 1. Demographic 
characteristics (age, height, level of education, 
place of residence, and work experience);  
2. Information related to the history of allergy 
and respiratory diseases; and 3. Symptoms of 
diseases similar to darkroom disease (such as 
headache, allergies, asthma, skin 
inflammation, burning eyes, and throat 
irritation) during the shift work. The method 
of scoring in this questionnaire is based on the 
Likert and Gutman scaling. Considering the 
fact that this tool was designed to investigate 
the darkroom disease, after getting the 
permission to use it, the steps of the study 
were evaluated in a preliminary study with  
30 people of the target group in order to assess 
the reliability of the questionnaire. The internal 

consistency of the items were calculated to 
determine the reliability of the history of 
allergic diseases with Cronbach's alpha of 0.84 
and 0.86 for the area related to the symptoms 
of darkroom disease. The coefficient alpha of 
the tool was also evaluated, and was still at the 
optimal level of 0.84.  

In order to maintain ethics in the research, the 
anonymity of the questionnaires, and the 
voluntary participation of the research units were 
among the cases considered as ethical principles; 
and the participants were assured that the data 
collected to conduct the scientific article was only 
available to researchers, and they could 
withdraw from the partnership at any time. 

After data collection, data was entered into 
SPSS software (version 19, SPSS Inc., Chicago, 
IL, USA). In order to analyze the data, the 
Kolmogorov-Smirnov test was used to 

examine the normal distribution of variables. 
Descriptive and analytical statistics such as 
chi-square test in agreement tables, 

independent t, and Pearson tests were also 
used. The significance level in all tests was 

considered as lower than 0.05. 

Results 

The mean age of radiotechnologists and nurses 

was 34.01 ± 7.9 and 32.33 ± 7.90 years, 
respectively; which was statistically different 
between the groups (P = 0.104). 31.58% of the 
samples were single, and the rest were 

married. More than 82% of radiotechnologists 
and 92% nurses had bachelor's degree. More 
than 94% of the samples were resident of the 

city. 95% of radiotechnologists stated that they 

prepared more than 15 X-ray images in one 
work shift, and also spent over 90 minutes 
(47.9%) of their work shift in the darkroom and 

in the vicinity of the processor device (Table 1). 
The prevalence of the symptoms of nausea 

(P = 0.001), runny nose (P = 0.001), oral ulcers 
(P = 0.020), oral burns (P = 0.001), skin rash  
(P = 0.001), blurry vision (P = 0.002), night  
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Table 1. Demographic information of the two studied groups of nurses and radiotechnologists 

Demographic information 
Radiotechnologists 

(n = 140) 

Nurses 

(n = 183) 
P 

Gender Men 47 (33.6) 11 (6.0) < 0.001 

Women 93 (66.4) 171 (94.0) 

Marital status Single 52 (37.1) 50 (28.4) 0.099 

Married 88 (62.9) 126 (71.6) 

Education Associate Degree 20 (14.3) 4 (2.2) < 0.001 

Bachelor's degree 116 (82.9) 165 (92.2) 

Master's degree 4 (2.9) 10 (5.6) 

Smoking 7 (5.0) 1 (0.5) < 0.001 

Second job 14 (10.0) 17 (9.3) 0.280 

Interested in changing the job 17 (12.3) 21 (11.7) 0.874 

Living in the factory environment 0 (0) 11 (6.0) 0.668 

Place of residence City 131 (93.6) 171 (95.0) 0.584 

Village 9 (6.4) 9 (5.0) 

Time spent in darkroom per work shift 1-30 minutes 53 (37.9) - - 

31-60 minutes 12 (8.6) 

61-90 minutes 8 (5.7) 

> 90 minutes 67 (47.9) 
The amounts are as number (percent). 

 
sweats (P = 0.001), chemical taste, (P = 0.001) 
and dysuria (P = 0.001) was statistically 
significant between the two groups of nurses 
and radiotechnologists, and these symptoms 
were observed more in radiotechnologists 
group. Unexplained fatigue (P = 0.001) was 
observed in nurses, while no case reported it in 

radiotechnologists (Table 2). In studying the 
gender and symptoms of darkroom  
disease in each occupational group, nausea 
 (P = 0.024) and runny nose (P = 0.001)  
in radiotechnologists, and chemical taste  
(P = 0.001) in nurses had significant  
relationship. 

 
Table 2. An overview of information related to darkroom disease among the two groups of nurses and 

radiotechnologists 

Symptom 
Radiotechnologists (n = 140) Nurses (n = 183) P (between the 

groups) n (%) P (with gender) n (%) P (with gender) 

Headache 71 (50.71) 0.261 108 (59.1) 0.111 0.137 

Nausea 34 (24.28) 0.024 17 (9.29) 0.275 0.001 

Runny nose 54 (38.57) 0.001 23 (12.57) 0.571 0.001 

Pharyngitis 40 (28.57) 0.071 36 (19.67) 0.522 0.062 

Unexplained fatigue 0 (0) 0.440 2 (1.10) 0.865 0.001 

Tinnitus 28 (20.00) 0.790 23 (12.57) 0.571 0.070 

Mouth  ulcers 19 (13.57) 0.748 6 (1.10) 0.530 0.001 

Abnormal heart rate 52 (37.14) 0.593 62 (33.88) 0.994 0.842 

Unusual anesthesia 43 (30.71) 0.828 44 (24.04) 0.806 0.181 

Skin rash 18 (12.85) 0.299 4 (2.20) 0.109 0.001 

Stomachache 23 (16.43) 0.274 23 (12.57) 0.571 0.325 

Blurry vision 26 (18.57) 0.212 13 (7.10) 0.345 0.002 

Dizziness 46 (32.85) 0.586 47 (25.68) 0.193 0.158 

Sneeze 33 (23.57) 0.221 30 (16.4) 0.876 0.107 

Night sweats 24 (17.14) 0.979 8 (4.37) 0.466 0.001 

Chemical taste 19 (13.57) 0.475 4 (2.20) 0.001 0.001 

Dysuria 17 (12.14) 0.353 5 (2.73) 0.567 0.001 
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Discussion 

Occupational diseases and providing 
prevention protocols has been among the 
important issues of increasing productivity 
and improving the quality of services in recent 
decades. The aim of this study was to 
investigate the prevalence of darkroom disease 
among radiotechnologists (target group) and 
nurses (control group) working in Guilan 
health centers. Symptoms of nausea, runny 
nose, mouth ulcers, tongue ulcers, skin rash, 
blurry vision, night sweats, chemical taste, and 
dysuria were more common in 
radiotechnologists than nurses, and a 
significant difference was reported between 
the two groups. In contrast, unexplained 
fatigue was observed more in nurses and a 
meaningful difference was observed. The 
results of this study could be due to the 
proximity and exposure to high concentrations 
of chemicals in the darkroom.11 47.9% of 
radiotechnologists spend more than 90 
minutes per shift in darkroom. This statistic is 
important; because it will be repeated in 
subsequent shifts on the same day. Excessive 
radiography in each work shift for each person 
is due to the lack of adequate staff allocation to 
the radiology departments, and the 
administration of unnecessary radiographies.  

The study showed that regarding the 
prevalence of darkroom diseases in 
radiotechnologists, headache, abnormal heart 
rate, runny nose, unusual anesthesia, 
pharyngitis, and dizziness were more than 
other symptoms. In the study of Jalalvandi et 
al.,11 headache, joint pain, unexplained fatigue, 
and burning eyes were the most frequent 
symptoms; whereas no case of unexplained 
fatigue was reported in the present study. In 
Majonga et al. study,23 chemical taste was the 
most frequent, which did not match with the 
results of the present study.  

In this study, there was no significant 
relationship between the work history of the 
research units and the darkroom 

complications, indicating that it was not 
effective. In addition, Jazayeri Gharebagh and 
Abaszadeh Ghanavati reported that shallow 
breathing in men (P = 0.045) and the whole 
group (P = 0.013), and nausea (P = 0.049) in the 
radiology group was significantly different 
from the control group. There was also the 
possibility of the relationship between the 
presence of skin inflammation and the history 
of this disease.22 Murty and Rao stated that 
symptoms such as headache and skin irritation 
were observed in radiotechnologists when 
working with the processor device.24  

In a comparative study between the 
radiotechnologists and physiotherapists in 
India, Tarlo et al. reported the darkroom 
disease symptoms in 7.8% (1483) of 
radiotechnologists and 1.8% (1545) of 
physiotherapists. In their research, in both 
occupations, the relationship between the 
psychosocial responses and the darkroom 
disease was observed. In addition, that 
darkroom disease had a significant relationship 
with the duration of proximity to chemical 
agents in the processor devise (P = 0.001).25  

Moreover, in a cross-sectional study in 
Palestine using purposeful and non-random 
sampling on 330 men radiotechnologists 
(study group) and 242 men nurses (control 
group), Al Zabadi and Nazzal stated that the 
symptoms were more prevalent in 
radiotechnologists compared to nurses  
(P < 0.001). Furthermore, based on the 
reported linear regression, staying more than 
thirty minutes in the darkroom in each shift 
had a significant effect on mean reported 
symptoms (P < 0.001). Moreover, the presence 
of ventilation in darkroom had a strong 
negative correlation with mean reported 
symptoms (P < 0.001).20 

Previous studies indicate that there is a 
relationship between unexplained fatigue and 
darkroom disease,11,20,23 which was not found 
in this study. In addition, the lack of 
significance of gender differences in the nurse 
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group was due to the low number of men in 
the nurse group. 

One of the important findings in this study 
was abnormal heartbeat, which was more than 
33% in both groups. Nevertheless, nurses and 
radiotechnologists often have to be employed in 
two or more hospitals, or even have other jobs 
due to the low salaries and benefits that are 
actually implemented in the health system, and 
the lack of labor rights and standards. Therefore, 
they do not observe the maximum working 
hours, and use drugs such as caffeine, ephedrine, 
or other performance-enhancing drugs, and are 
exposed to stress and severe occupational 
anxiety, all of which are the causes and factors 
that increase the risk of abnormal heartbeat.17,26,27 
Moreover, the effect of X-ray on the thyroid 
gland and unbalance in the basic conditions of 
the thyroid mechanism can be a major risk factor 
for this complication.28-30 

Sulfur dioxide, a secondary product of the 
film-forming process, can lead to unpleasant 
metallic taste [a type of taste deficiency 
(dysgeusia)], and bad breath that requires 
special monitoring.11,16 In nurses, this may be 
due to low quality food in healthcare facilities 
due to longer shifts, insomnia, and vitamin D 
deficiency due to working in closed 
environments and environmental chemicals 
(including benzene, hydrazine, gasoline, 
lacquers, chromate, and cobalt) that should be 
inhaled for a long period.31-34 

According to the results of a study by 
Jazayeri Gharebagh and Abaszadeh 
Ghanavati, the prevalence of darkroom disease 
was reported to be more in morning shift.22 
This may be due to the replacement of 
medications in the morning before the 
department opens in the morning or at night. 
The factors that increase the prevalence 
darkroom disease in morning shift include 
more severe vapors of the new drug, more 
damaging smell of the drug in the morning, 
the accumulation of chemical vapors around 
the device due to the shutting down of the 

darkroom ventilation system at night, and not 
opening the door of the darkroom during  
the night.  

In most countries of the world, as well as in 
the densely populated centers of Iran, the use 
of digital devices, such as cassette reader and 
printers has replaced the old darkroom system, 
and the introduction of computed and digital 
radiography devices have somehow controlled 
the syndrome of darkroom disease; but these 
effects are still observed in many 
radiotechnologists in Guilan province and in 
different countries.   

Darkroom disease, along with occupational 
musculoskeletal disorders,35 and the effects of 
ionizing on the body and next generations,36 
are occupational hazards among the 
radiotechnologists. Issues such as unhealthy 
competition in the work environment, higher 
wages for more work, and the inappropriate 
nature of certain occupational standards and 
environmental conditions may increase the 
chance of darkroom disease. In this case, 
reducing job inconvenience, modifying the 
environment, and supplying modern 
equipment can increase the quality of services 
and the status of personnel health. Obviously, 
lack of timely modifications would be harmful 
for people health in due time.37-39 

Conclusion 

Darkroom disease is of occupational hazards 
among the radiotechnologists. In order to 
provide a safe working environment, provide 
quality service to patients, and update imaging 
and film-forming processes in accordance with 
new standards and achievements in the world, 
more appropriate policies should be adopted 
by the health organization of Iran. 

Conflict of Interests 

Authors have no conflict of interests. 

Acknowledgments 

Hereby, we would like to thank the Deputy for 



 

 

 
 

http://cdjournal.muk.ac.ir,    15 April 

The Darkroom Disease Yektakooshali  et al .  

   Chron Dis J, Vol. 6, No. 2, Spring 2018   71 

Research of Guilan University of Medical 
Sciences for financial and spiritual support. We 
would also like to thank the Student Research 
Committee of this University for welcoming 
the research work of the students. This article 
is the result of a research project approved by 
the Guilan University of Medical Sciences with 
the ethics code of IR.GUMS.REC.1395.89. 

References 

1. Kolarzyk E, Stepniewski M, Zapolska I. Occurrence 

of pulmonary diseases in steel mill workers. Int J 

Occup Med Environ Health 2000; 13(2): 103-12. 

2. Department of Health and Human Services. Niosh 

pocket guide to chemical hazards. Pittsburgh, PA: 

DHHS (NIOSH) Publication; 2007. 

3. Dykewicz MS. Occupational respiratory and 

dermatologic disease. Prim Care 1987; 14(3): 559-73. 

4. Chan-Yeung M, Lam S. Occupational asthma. Am 

Rev Respir Dis 1986; 133(4): 686-703. 

5. Takigawa T, Endo Y. Effects of glutaraldehyde 

exposure on human health. J Occup Health 2006; 

48(2): 75-87. 

6. Hewitt PJ. Occupational health problems in 

processing of X-ray photographic films. Ann Occup 

Hyg 1993; 37(3): 287-95. 

7. Smedley J, Inskip H, Wield G, Coggon D. Work 

related respiratory symptoms in radiographers. Occup 

Environ Med 1996; 53(7): 450-4. 

8. Genton M. Shedding light on darkroom disease-

progress and challenges in understanding radiology 

workers' occupational illness. Can J Med Radiat 

Technol 1998; 29: 60-5. 

9. Glass B. Exposure to glutaraldehyde alone or in a 

fume mix. MAG Mem Sem and Shadows 1997; 

40(2). 

10. Spicer J, Hay DM, Gordon M. Workplace exposure 

and reported health in New Zealand diagnostic 

radiographers. Australas Radiol 1986; 30(3): 281-6. 

11. Jalalvandi M, Noori Tahne H, Fakhri M, Babaee S, 

Askari M. A comparison of the prevalence of the 

darkroom diseases syndrome between the 

radiographers and critical care nurses in the selected 

hospitals of University of Medical Sciences in 

Kermanshah, 2014. J Clin Res Paramed Sci 2015; 

4(3): 204-12. [In Persian]. 

12. Gordon M. Reactions to chemical fumes in radiology 

departments. Radiography 1987; 53(608): 85-9. 

13. Teschke K, Chow Y, Brauer M, Chessor E, Hirtle B, 

Kennedy SM, et al. Exposures and their determinants 

in radiographic film processing. AIHA J (Fairfax, 

Va) 2002; 63(1): 11-21. 

14. Sanchez T. When it hurts to breathe: Chemicals and 

RTs. ASRT Scanner 1999; 31: 6-8. 

15. Hansen KS. Glutaraldehyde occupational dermatitis. 

Contact Dermatitis 1983; 9(1): 81-2. 

16. Smith DR, Wang RS. Glutaraldehyde exposure and 

its occupational impact in the health care 

environment. Environ Health Prev Med 2006; 11(1): 

3-10. 

17. Misher J, Goldin M, Karim I.  Abnormal Heart Rate. 

In: Manu P, Karlin-Zysman C, Editors. Handbook of 

Medicine in Psychiatry. Philadelphia, PA: American 

Psychiatric Pub; 2015. 

18. Dargan RS. Uncovering the roots of 'darkroom 

disease'. EASRT Scanner 2011; 43(3): 22. 

19. Nallon AM, Herity B, Brennan PC. Do symptomatic 

radiographers provide evidence for 'darkroom 

disease'? Occup Med (Lond) 2000; 50(1): 39-42. 

20. Al Zabadi H, Nazzal Y. Evaluation of Darkroom 

disease's symptoms among radiographers in the West 

Bank hospitals: A cross-sectional study in Palestine. J 

Occup Med Toxicol 2014; 9: 15. 

21. Damases C. An evaluation of sulphur dioxide fume 

levels and the prevalence of darkroom disease 

symptoms amongst radiology workers in Namibia 

[Online]. [MSc Thesis]. Durban, Namibia: 

Department of Radiography, Durban University of 

Technology; 2006. Available from: URL: 

http://repository.unam.edu.na/handle/11070/350 

22. Jazayeri Gharebagh E, Abaszadeh Ghanavati M. A 

comparative study on the incidence of symptoms 

known as "Darkroom Disease" amongst X-ray 

department personnel & physiotherapists. Payavard 

Salamat 2008; 1(2): 52-9. [In Persian]. 

23. Majonga E, Karera A, Zanga A, Kowo F. The 

prevalence and severity of the symptoms of darkroom 

disease among darkroom technicians in Harare, 

Zimbabwe. World Journal of Medical Sciences 2013; 

8(2): 113-7. 

24. Murty PS, Rao KL. Assessment of risk at workplace: 

A study on radiographers work practices in Vizag 

Steel. Indian J Occup Environ Med 2005; 9(1): 26. 

25. Tarlo SM, Liss GM, Greene JM, Purdham J, 

McCaskell L, Kipen H, et al. Work-attributed 

symptom clusters (darkroom disease) among 

radiographers versus physiotherapists: Associations 

between self-reported exposures and psychosocial 

stressors. Am J Ind Med 2004; 45(6): 513-21. 

26. Schulte-Frohlinde V, Ashkenazy Y, Ivanov PC, Glass 

L, Goldberger AL, Stanley HE. Noise effects on the 

complex patterns of abnormal heartbeats. Phys Rev 

Lett 2001; 87(6): 068104. 

27. Watanabe J, Thamilarasan M, Blackstone EH, 

Thomas JD, Lauer MS. Heart rate recovery 

immediately after treadmill exercise and left 



 

 

 
 

http://cdjournal.muk.ac.ir,    15 April  

The Darkroom Disease Yektakooshali  et al. 

  72   Chron Dis J, Vol. 6, No. 2, Spring 2018 

ventricular systolic dysfunction as predictors of 

mortality: The case of stress echocardiography. 

Circulation 2001; 104(16): 1911-6. 

28. Polikar R, Burger AG, Scherrer U, Nicod P. The thyroid 

and the heart. Circulation 1993; 87(5): 1435-41. 

29. Wikstrom L, Johansson C, Salto C, Barlow C, Campos 

Barros A, Baas F, et al. Abnormal heart rate and body 

temperature in mice lacking thyroid hormone receptor 

alpha 1. EMBO J 1998; 17(2): 455-61. 

30. Wang JX, Boice JD Jr, Li BX, Zhang JY, Fraumeni 

JF Jr. Cancer among medical diagnostic x-ray 

workers in China. J Natl Cancer Inst 1988; 80(5): 

344-50. 

31. Padala KP, Hinners CK, Padala PR. Mirtazapine 

therapy for dysgeusia in an elderly patient. Prim Care 

Companion J Clin Psychiatry 2006; 8(3): 178-80. 

32. Williams R, Virtue K, Adkins A. Room service 

improves patient food intake and satisfaction with 

hospital food. J Pediatr Oncol Nurs 1998; 15(3): 183-9. 

33. Markley EJ, Mattes-Kulig DA, Henkin RI. A 

classification of dysgeusia. J Am Diet Assoc 1983; 

83(5): 578-80. 

34. Sullivan JB, Krieger GR. Clinical environmental 

health and toxic exposures. Philadelphia, PA: 

Lippincott Williams & Wilkins; 2001. 

35. Lorusso A, Vimercati L, L'Abbate N. 

Musculoskeletal complaints among Italian X-ray 

technology students: a cross-sectional questionnaire 

survey. BMC Res Notes 2010; 3(1): 114. 

36. Shafiee M, Rashidfar R, Borzoueisileh S, Ghorbani 

M, Vafapour H, Rahimi S. The Effect of occupational 

exposure on blood parameters of radiology staffs in 

Yasuj. Armaghane-Danesh 2016; 21(4): 410-9.  

[In Persian]. 

37. Feyzi V, Mehdipoor S, Ghotbi Ravandi MR, Asadi 

M, Ghafori S. Ergonomic assessment of workstations 

and musculoskeletal disorders risk assessment in the 

central oil refinery workshop of Hormozgan 

province. J Health Dev 2015; 4(4): 315-26. 

38. Mansouri A, Adhami Mojarad MR, Badfar G, 

Abasian L, Rahmati S, Kooti W, et al. Epidemiology 

of Toxoplasma gondii among blood donors in Iran: A 

systematic review and meta-analysis. Transfus Apher 

Sci 2017; 56(3): 404-9. 

39. ZakerJafari HR, YektaKooshali MH. Work-Related 

Musculoskeletal Disorders in Iranian Dentists: A 

Systematic Review and Meta-analysis. Saf Health 

Work 2018; 9(1): 1-9. 

 


